



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
Highway Department
124-126 River Road
Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Bituminous Road Materials</u>		
Bid Price	Material	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$3.30	CRS-2	Peckham Road Corp.
\$3.25	CRS-2P	Peckham Road Corp.
\$3.45	CMS-2	Peckham Road Corp.
\$3.85	CMS-2P	Peckham Road Corp.
\$2,400.00	Self-Propelled Chip Spreader (8 Hours With Operator)	Peckham Road Corp.
\$3,500.00	Cold Mix Paver (8 Hours With Operator)	Gorman Brothers
\$2,200.00	Rubber Tire Roller (8 Hours With Operator)	Peckham Road Corp.
\$2,200.00	Steel Wheeled Roller (8 Hours With Operator)	Peckham Road Corp.
\$650.00	Equipment Mobilization (Each)	Peckham Road Corp. / Gorman Brothers

** FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor **



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Blacktop FOB		
Bid Price	Material	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$114.00	Cold	Peckham Material Corp.
\$85.00	Type 9.5 MM	Peckham Material Corp.
\$82.00	Type 12.5 MM	Peckham Material Corp.
\$80.00	Type 19.0 MM	Peckham Material Corp.
\$80.00	Type 25.0 MM	Peckham Material Corp.
\$80.00	Type 37.5 MM	Peckham Material Corp.
\$90.00	6.3 Non-Polymer Modified	Peckham Material Corp.
\$80.00	Type-1	Peckham Material Corp.
\$80.00	Type-2	Peckham Material Corp.
\$80.00	Type-6	Peckham Material Corp.
\$82.00	Type-7	Peckham Material Corp.
<i>No Bid</i>	Curbing Mix	<i>No Bid</i>

** FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor **



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
Highway Department
124-126 River Road
Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Corrugated Polyethylene Tubing</u>		
Bid Price	Material	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$0.89	4" X 100' Roll	Carmel Winwater, Chemung Supply, Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$0.89	4" X 500' Roll	Carmel Winwater, Chemung Supply, Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$2.03	6" X 100' Roll	Carmel Winwater, Chemung Supply, Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$2.03	6" X 500' Roll	Carmel Winwater, Chemung Supply, Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$6.00	8" X 100' Roll	Carmel Winwater, Chemung Supply, Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$0.00	Delivery Charge	Carmel Winwater, Chemung Supply, Expanded Supply Products, Inc.

** FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor **



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Crushed (By the Ton)</u>					
Bid Price	Material - FOB	2024 Material Bid Winners	Bid Price	Material - Delivered	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$20.25	1/4"	Peckham Material Corp.	\$29.25	1/4"	Peckham Material Corp.
\$19.25	3/8"	Peckham Material Corp.	\$28.25	3/8"	Peckham Material Corp.
\$19.25	1/2"	Peckham Material Corp.	\$28.25	1/2"	Peckham Material Corp.
\$19.25	3/4"	Peckham Material Corp.	\$28.25	3/4"	Peckham Material Corp.
\$19.25	1 1/2"	Peckham Material Corp.	\$28.25	1 1/2"	Peckham Material Corp.
\$24.25	2 1/2"	Wingdale Material, LLC	\$30.25	2 1/2"	Wingdale Material, LLC
\$18.00	Quarry (Crushed) 3/4" Item 4	Putnam Material Corp.	\$24.00	Quarry (Crushed) 3/4" Item 4	Putnam Material Corp.
\$17.00	Quarry (Crushed) 1.5" Item 4	Putnam Material Corp.	\$23.00	Quarry (Crushed) 1.5" Item 4	Putnam Material Corp.
\$23.00	Fine Stone Fill	Peckham Material Corp.	\$32.00	Fine Stone Fill	Peckham Material Corp.
\$23.00	Light Stone Fill	Peckham Material Corp.	\$32.00	Light Stone Fill	Peckham Material Corp.
\$30.00	Medium Stone Fill	Peckham Material Corp.	\$43.00	Medium Stone Fill	Peckham Material Corp.
\$24.25	Crushed Aggregate 2"	Wingdale Material, LLC	\$30.25	Crushed Aggregate 2"	Wingdale Material, LLC
\$18.50	Stone Dust	Wingdale Material, LLC	\$24.50	Stone Dust	Wingdale Material, LLC
			No Bid	#4 ROB Screened	No Bid

** FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor **



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Crushed (By the Yard)</u>					
Bid Price	Material - FOB	2024 Material Bid Winner	Bid Price	Material - Delivered	2024 Material Bid Winner
<i>No Bid</i>	1/4"	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	1/4"	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	3/8"	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	3/8"	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	1/2"	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	1/2"	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	3/4"	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	3/4"	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	1 1/2"	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	1 1/2"	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	2 1/2"	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	2 1/2"	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Quarry (Crushed) 3/4" Item 4	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	Quarry (Crushed) 3/4" Item 4	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Quarry (Crushed) 1.5" Item 4	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	#4 ROB Screened	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Light Stone Fill	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	Quarry (Crushed) #4	<i>No Bid</i>
\$18.00	Crushed Aggregate 2"	Earth Alterations, LLC	<i>No Bid</i>	Light Stone Fill	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Stone Dust	<i>No Bid</i>	\$24.50	Crushed Aggregate 2"	Earth Alterations, LLC
<i>No Bid</i>	Screened Top Soil	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	Stone Dust	<i>No Bid</i>
			<i>No Bid</i>	Screened Top Soil	<i>No Bid</i>

* FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor *



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Drainage Pipe</u>				
Bid Price	Material	2024 Material Bid Winners		
\$10.07	12" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$14.03	15" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$18.20	18" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$32.54	24" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$45.56	30" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$60.82	36" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$85.43	42" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$99.67	48" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
170.86	60" IB	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
\$0.00	Delivery Charge	Carmel Winwater	Chemung Supply Corp.	Expanded Supply Products, Inc.

** FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor **



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Cast Iron Grates & Frames - Delivered</u>		
Bid Price	Material	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$646.23	30" X 48"	Carmel Winwater
\$333.44	30" X 30" / 6" Flat Top	Carmel Winwater
\$228.19	24" X 24" / Wide Flange Reversible	Carmel Winwater
\$524.26	30" X 30" / 6" Frames Curb Back	Carmel Winwater
<u>Concrete Catch Basins - Delivered</u>		
Bid Price	Material	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$227.78	30" X 48" X 3' (With 6" Wall)	Carmel Winwater
\$277.78	30" X 48" X 4' (With 6" Wall)	Carmel Winwater
<i>No Bids</i>	30" X 48" X 5' (With 6" Wall)	<i>No Bids</i>
\$197.98	30" X 30" X 30"	Carmel Winwater

* FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor *



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Plow Steel & Shoes</u>		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$12.50	5/8" X 6' Per Foot	Chemung Supply Corp.
\$14.50	5/8" X 8" Per Foot	Chemung Supply Corp.
\$115.00	OST 2400 8"	Chemung Supply Corp.
\$70.00	OST 400 4"	Chemung Supply Corp.
\$50.00	OST 1550 Curb Finder	Chemung Supply Corp.
\$60.00	OST 750 Large Nose Piece	Chemung Supply Corp.
\$58.00	OST 700 Small Nose Piece	Chemung Supply Corp.
\$61.00	Carbide Per Foot	Chemung Supply Corp.
Included	Delivery Charge	Chemung Supply Corp.

** FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor **



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
Highway Department
124-126 River Road
Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Snow, Ice & Dust Control</u>		
Bid Price	Material	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$1.20	Magnesium Chloride Liquid	Peckham Material Corp.
\$1.20	Calcium Chloride Liquid	Peckham Material Corp.
\$2.60	IBG Magic	DJM Distribution & Supply Inc.

** FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor **



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
Highway Department
124-126 River Road
Pawling, NY 12564

Street Sweeping & Catch Basin Cleaning		
Bid Price	Rates	2024 Material Bid Winners
<i>No Bids</i>	Hourly Rate: Street Sweeping	<i>No Bids</i>
\$275.00	Hourly Rate: Catch Basin Cleaning	T&A Construction Inc.



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
Highway Department
124-126 River Road
Pawling, NY 12564

Tree Work		
Bid Price	Rates	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$125.00	Hourly Rate: Chipper 6" (Without Operator)	Alpine Tree Service Inc.
\$250.00	Hourly Rate: Bucket Truck with 70' Minimum Working Height (With Operator & One Ground Man)	Alpine Tree Service Inc.
\$150.00	Hourly Rate: Vermeer 665 Stump Grinder or Equal (With Operator)	Alpine Tree Service Inc.
\$100.00	Hourly Rate: Log Loader Truck (With Operator)	Alpine Tree Service Inc.



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Washed ROB (By the Ton)					
Bid Price	Material - FOB	2024 Material Bid Winners	Bid Price	Material - Delivered	2024 Material Bid Winners
\$13.00	1/4"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$18.50	1/4"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$18.00	3/8"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$23.50	3/8"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$18.00	1/2"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$23.50	1/2"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$19.00	3/4"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$24.50	3/4"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$18.00	1 1/2"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$23.50	1 1/2"	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
<i>No Bids</i>	2 1/2"	<i>No Bids</i>	<i>No Bids</i>	2 1/2"	<i>No Bids</i>
\$17.00	Tailings	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$22.50	Tailings	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$14.00	Ice Sand	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$19.50	Ice Sand	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$17.00	ROB Gravel	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$22.50	ROB Gravel	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$18.00	Screened ROB Gravel #4	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$23.50	Screened ROB Gravel #4	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$28.00	Topsoil Screened	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$32.50	Topsoil Screened	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$24.00	Topsoil Unscreened	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$29.50	Topsoil Unscreened	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.
\$18.00	1 1/2" Screened (Not Washed)	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.	\$23.50	1 1/2" Screened (Not Washed)	Harlem Valley Sand & Gravel, Inc.

** FOB material bids are subject to additional consideration for best value which include expenditures made for mileage and labor **



2024 Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Washed ROB (By the Yard)			
Bid Price	Material - By The Yard (FOB)	Bid Price	Material - By The Yard (Delivered)
No Bids	1/4"	No Bids	1/4"
No Bids	3/8"	No Bids	3/8"
No Bids	1/2"	No Bids	1/2"
No Bids	3/4"	No Bids	3/4"
No Bids	1 1/2"	No Bids	1 1/2"
No Bids	2 1/2"	No Bids	2 1/2"
No Bids	Tailings	No Bids	Tailings
No Bids	Ice Sand	No Bids	Ice Sand
No Bids	ROB Gravel	No Bids	ROB Gravel
No Bids	Screened ROB Gravel #4	No Bids	Screened ROB Gravel #4
No Bids	Topsoil Screened	No Bids	Topsoil Screened
No Bids	Topsoil Unscreened	No Bids	Topsoil Unscreened
No Bids	3/4" Screened (Not Washed)	No Bids	3/4" Screened (Not Washed)
No Bids	1 1/2" Screened (Not Washed)	No Bids	1 1/2" Screened (Not Washed)
No Bids	Tailings Screened (Not Washed)	No Bids	Tailings Screened (Not Washed)



2024 Labor Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
Highway Department
124-126 River Road
Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Day Labor</u>		
Bid Price	Rates	2024 Labor Bid Winners
\$60.00	Hourly Rate	Earth Alterations, LLC
\$480.00	Daily Rate	
\$2,400.00	Weekly Rate	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Tri-Axle Dump Truck With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
Mack (2)	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
20 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$150.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,200.00	Daily Rate	
\$5,800.00	Weekly Rate	
4 Hours	Min. Rental Fee	
\$0.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$0.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
KW T800	Make & Model of Equipment	Earth Alterations, LLC
20 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$150.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,200.00	Daily Rate	
\$6,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,200.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$0.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$0.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
International 5500I	Make & Model of Equipment	Landworks Excavating, Inc.
20 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$150.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,200.00	Daily Rate	
\$6,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,200.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$0.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$0.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - 2 Yard Loader <i>With Operator</i>		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Komatsu 250	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
2.25 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$225.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,800.00	Daily Rate	
\$8,500.00	Weekly Rate	
4 Hours	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - 3 Yard Loader With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Deere 544	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
3 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$250.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Daily Rate	
\$9,500.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
CAT 924	Make & Model of Equipment	Earth Altarations, LLC
2.5 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$200.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,600.00	Daily Rate	
\$7,600.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,600.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$200.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$0.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Komatsu WA200	Make & Model of Equipment	Kent Construction Corp.
3 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$250.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Daily Rate	
\$10,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,000.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$300.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$0.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Hydraulic Rock Breaker Excavator With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
Kubota 80	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
8 Ton	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$250.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Daily Rate	
\$9,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
Komatsu 130	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
13 Ton	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$275.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,200.00	Daily Rate	
\$10,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,200.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
CAT 315	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
15 Ton	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$300.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,400.00	Daily Rate	
\$11,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,400.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Hydraulic Rock Breaker Excavator With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
Komatsu 290	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
30 Ton	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$365.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,900.00	Daily Rate	
\$14,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,900.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$275.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$275.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
Kobelco 115	Make & Model of Equipment	Earth Alterations, LLC
	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$255.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,040.00	Daily Rate	
\$10,200.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,040.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$0.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
Volvo 240	Make & Model of Equipment	Earth Alterations, LLC
	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$300.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,400.00	Daily Rate	
\$11,500.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,400.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$200.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$200.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Hydraulic Rock Breaker Excavator With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winner
140 Kobelco	Make & Model of Equipment	Earth Alterations, LLC
	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$185.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,480.00	Daily Rate	
\$7,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,480.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Hydraulic, Excavator, Track, Mtd With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
CAT 305	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
5 Ton	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$175.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,400.00	Daily Rate	
\$6,500.00	Weekly Rate	
4 Hours	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
CAT 315	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
15 Ton	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$225.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,800.00	Daily Rate	
\$8,500.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,800.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
CAT 320 Long Reach	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
20 Ton	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$350.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,800.00	Daily Rate	
\$13,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,800.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$275.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$275.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Hydraulic, Excavator, Track, Mtd With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Komatsu 240	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
24 Ton	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$250.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Daily Rate	
\$9,500.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$275.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$275.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Komatsu 290	Make & Model of Equipment	Amaxx, Inc.
30 Tons	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$265.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,100.00	Daily Rate	
\$10,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,100.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$275.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$275.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Volvo 240	Make & Model of Equipment	Earth Alterations, LLC
2 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$250.00	Hourly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Daily Rate	
\$10,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$2,000.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$200.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$200.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Hydraulic, Excavator, Track, Mtd With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Kubota 55	Make & Model of Equipment	Earth Alterations, LLC
	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$180.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,440.00	Daily Rate	
\$7,200.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,440.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$100.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$100.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Kubota 80	Make & Model of Equipment	Earth Alterations, LLC
	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$155.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,240.00	Daily Rate	
\$6,200.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,240.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$0.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
U55 Kubota w/ 1250 Lb. Hammer	Make & Model of Equipment	T&A Construction
0.3 CY	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$220.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,950.00	Daily Rate	
\$8,200.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,000.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Equipment Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Hydraulic, Excavator, Track, Mtd With Operator		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
John Deere 200	Make & Model of Equipment	Landworks Excavating, Inc.
	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$225.00	Hourly Rate	
\$1,800.00	Daily Rate	
\$9,000.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,800.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$150.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$150.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
Kubota 57 Mini Exc.	Make & Model of Equipment	Landworks Excavating, Inc.
	Cubic Yard Capacity	
Yes	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	
\$187.50	Hourly Rate	
\$1,500.00	Daily Rate	
\$7,500.00	Weekly Rate	
\$1,500.00	Min. Rental Fee	
\$0.00	Delivery Charge Amount	
\$0.00	Pick Up Charge Amount	



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
Highway Department
124-126 River Road
Pawling, NY 12564

Equipment Rental - Hydraulic Rock Breaker Excavator <i>Without Operator</i>		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Equipment Bid Winners
<i>No Bid</i>	Make & Model of Equipment	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Cubic Yard Capacity	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Hourly Rate	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Daily Rate	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Weekly Rate	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Min. Rental Fee	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Delivery Charge Amount	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Pick Up Charge Amount	<i>No Bid</i>



2024 Material Bid Winners

Town of Pawling
 Highway Department
 124-126 River Road
 Pawling, NY 12564

<u>Equipment Rental - Hydraulic, Excavator, Track, Mtd</u> <i>Without Operator</i>		
Bid Price	Equipment & Rates	2024 Material Bid Winners
<i>No Bid</i>	Make & Model of Equipment	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Cubic Yard Capacity	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Fuel Included With Equipment (Yes / No)	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Hourly Rate	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Daily Rate	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Weekly Rate	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Min. Rental Fee	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Delivery Charge Amount	<i>No Bid</i>
<i>No Bid</i>	Pick Up Charge Amount	<i>No Bid</i>